

.25", 1.0", 1.5" CRUSHED CHIP ROCK				ARMSTRONG RENTALS LLC.		JEFFRES SAND AND GRAVEL INC		NSG LOGISTICS, LLC DBA NEBRASKA SALT AND GRAIN		WESTOVER ROCK & SAND, INC.	
LINE #	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
.25" WASHED CRUSHED RUN ROCK & DELIVERY LOCATIONS											
1	DISTRICT 1 SEWARD YARD 2500 S HIGHWAY 15 SEWARD NE 68434-2753	670	TN	\$ 43.50	\$ 29,145.00			\$ 40.60	\$ 27,202.00	\$ 40.75	\$ 27,302.50
2	DISTRICT 1 DORCHESTER, NE 68343 1/2 MILE EAST OF DORCHESTER ON HWY 33	2500	TN	\$ 42.75	\$ 106,875.00	\$43.91/TON	\$ 109,775.00	\$ 41.10	\$ 102,750.00	\$ 41.30	\$ 103,250.00
3	DISTRICT 1 WILBER NE, 68465 11 MILES WEST OF WILBER ON HWY 41	2500	TN	\$ 42.75	\$ 106,875.00	\$43.39/TON	\$ 108,475.00	NO BID		\$ 42.00	\$ 105,000.00
1" CRUSHED RUN ROCK & DELIVERY LOCATIONS											
4	DISTRICT 6 OCONTO YARD, OCONTO NE, 68860 HWY #21 MILE POST 89	50	TN	\$ 62.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$54.40/TON	\$ 2,720.00	\$ 69.65	\$ 3,482.50	NO BID	
5	DISTRICT 6 BIG SPRINGS YARD 114 FRONTAGE RD BIG SPRINGS, 69122	100	TN	\$ 84.00	\$ 8,400.00	\$75.45/TON	\$ 7,545.00	NO BID		\$ 71.75	\$ 7,175.00
1.5" CRUSHED RUN ROCK & DELIVERY LOCATIONS											
6	DISTRICT 1 WAHOO YARD 2311 ASPEN ST WAHOO NE 68066-5542	250	TN	\$ 30.50	\$ 7,625.00	\$31.95/TON	\$ 7,987.50	\$ 31.50	\$ 7,875.00	\$ 30.10	\$ 7,525.00
7	DISTRICT 1 GREENWOOD YARD (12909 238TH ST, GREENWOOD NE 68366-2119)	250	TN	\$ 26.50	\$ 6,625.00	\$29.25/TON	\$ 7,312.50	\$ 31.55	\$ 7,887.50	\$ 26.20	\$ 6,550.00
8	DISTRICT 1 DAVID CITY YARD (235 IOWA ST., DAVID CITY NE 68632-2163)	250	TN	\$ 35.00	\$ 8,750.00	\$36.55/TON	\$ 9,137.50	\$ 38.30	\$ 9,575.00	\$ 33.50	\$ 8,375.00
9	DISTRICT 1 SEWARD YARD 2500 S HIGHWAY 15 SEWARD NE 68434-2753	250	TN	\$ 33.50	\$ 8,375.00	\$34.70/TON	\$ 8,675.00	\$ 35.30	\$ 8,825.00	\$ 32.55	\$ 8,137.50
10	DISTRICT 1 HUMBOLDT HWY 4 MP 204	1500	TN	\$ 31.50	\$ 47,250.00	\$33.70/TON	\$ 50,550.00	NO BID		\$ 29.75	\$ 44,625.00

1.5" CRUSHED RUN ROCK & DELIVERY LOCATIONS											
11	DISTRICT 1 NEBRASKA CITY SHOP 6170 HIGHWAY 75 NEBRASKA CITY NE 68410-3382	1000	TN	\$ 28.00	\$ 28,000.00	\$29.00/TON	\$ 29,000.00	NO BID		\$ 27.50	\$ 27,500.00
12	DISTRICT 1 DUNBAR SHOP 105 E NEBRASKA ST DUNBAR, NE 68346	1000	TN	\$ 27.00	\$ 27,000.00	\$29.00/TON	\$ 29,000.00	NO BID		\$ 26.65	\$ 26,650.00
13	DISTRICT 1 PALMYRA SHOP 510 F ROAD PALMYRA NE 68418-4055	500	TN	\$ 23.75	\$ 11,875.00	\$28.25/TON	\$ 14,125.00	NO BID		\$ 26.90	\$ 13,450.00
14	DISTRICT 1 FALLS CITY SHOP 1525 E 14TH ST FALLS CITY NE 68355-2480	500	TN	\$ 35.00	\$ 17,500.00	\$38.25/TON	\$ 19,125.00	\$ 39.45	\$ 19,725.00	\$ 33.50	\$ 16,750.00
15	DISTRICT 1 TECUMSEH HWY 136 MP 209 1 MILE EAST OF TECUMSEH NE, 68450	1000	TN	\$ 28.75	\$ 28,750.00	\$29.00/TON	\$ 29,000.00	NO BID		\$ 27.70	\$ 27,700.00
16	DISTRICT 2 FREMONT HWY 30 WEST 2550 W 23RD DR FREMONT NE 68026-0651	400	TN	\$ 32.00	\$ 12,800.00			\$ 28.45	\$ 11,380.00	\$ 31.75	\$ 12,700.00
17	DISTRICT 2 BLAIR 2252 PITTACK ST. BLAIR NE 68008-2384	400	TN	\$ 31.60	\$ 12,640.00			\$ 25.15	\$ 10,060.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 11,900.00
18	DISTRICT 2 OMAHA 4425 S 108TH ST. OMAHA NE 68145-0461	250	TN	\$ 29.25	\$ 7,312.50			25.75	\$ 6,437.50	\$ 29.75	\$ 7,437.50
19	DISTRICT 2 MORMON BRIDGE 5015 BATTLEFIELD DR. OMAHA NE 68152-1560	250	TN	\$ 29.80	\$ 7,450.00			26.75	\$ 6,687.50	\$ 29.75	\$ 7,437.50
20	DISTRICT 2 SOUTH OMAHA 5929 S 25TH ST. OMAHA NE 68107-4408	250	TN	\$ 29.40	\$ 7,350.00			NO BID		\$ 30.75	\$ 7,687.50

1.5" CRUSHED RUN ROCK & DELIVERY LOCATIONS											
21	DISTRICT 2 MELIA HILL 15525 S 234TH ST. GRETNA NE 68028-6571	400	TN	\$ 27.25	\$ 10,900.00			28.85	\$ 11,540.00	\$ 27.45	\$ 10,980.00
22	DISTRICT 2 ELKHORN 2829 N 204TH ST. ELKHORN NE 68022-0524	400	TN	\$ 32.00	\$ 12,800.00			\$ 26.50	\$ 10,600.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 11,800.00
23	DISTRICT 2 PLATSMOUTH 1000 S 22ND ST. PLATTSMOUTH NE 68048-2705	400	TN	\$ 27.25	\$ 10,900.00			NO BID		\$ 27.40	\$ 10,960.00
24	DISTRICT 6 OGALLALA YARD 307 E D-ST SOUTH	300	TN	\$ 84.00	\$ 25,200.00	\$67.00/TON	\$ 20,100.00	\$ 69.45	\$ 20,835.00	\$ 69.25	\$ 20,775.00
25	DISTRICT 6 BIG SPRINGS YARD 114 FRONTAGE RD BIG SPRINGS	500	TN	\$ 84.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$70.00/TON	\$ 35,000.00	NO BID		\$ 71.75	\$ 35,875.00
26	DISTRICT 6 MULLEN YARD 402 WEST 1ST ST. MULLEN	100	TN	\$ 81.00	\$ 8,100.00	\$67.00/TON	\$ 67,000.00	NO BID		\$ 74.75	\$ 7,475.00
TOTAL:					\$ 603,597.50		\$ 554,527.50		\$ 264,862.00		\$ 575,017.50
PAYMENT TERMS:				Net% 30 DAYS		Net% 30 DAYS		Net% 30 DAYS			
DELIVERY DAYS ARO:				14		AS REQUIRED		14-21		AS REQUESTED	
COMMENTS:				LINES 1-3: *ALT 3/8" WASHED*						LINES 1-3: BID 3/8" WASHED CRUSHED RUN ROCK	